

# BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: **Warren Consolidated Schools**  
**District-Wide Technology Improvements**  
**Bid Package No. T4**  
**Warren, Michigan**

IDS Project No.:  
 Date:

**22177-1000 BP-T4**  
**April 11, 2024**

	Bluum	MOSS Audio Corporation	The DataCom Group, Inc.	Digital Age Technologies, Inc.	VSC, Inc.
<b>Bid Bond</b>	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
<b>Familiar Disclosure</b>	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
<b>Iran Sanctions Act</b>	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
<b>Base Bid No. 1</b>	\$205,540.36	\$235,913.81	No Bid	No Bid	\$244,890.00
<b>Base Bid No. 1 - Mandatory Alternate No. 1</b>	\$37,825.00	\$89,716.02	N/A	N/A	\$52,440.00
<b>Base Bid No. 1 - Mandatory Alternate No. 2</b>	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$0.00
<b>Base Bid No. 1 - Voluntary Alternate No. 1</b>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>Base Bid No. 1 - Unit Pricing</b>	Yes	Yes	N/A	N/A	Yes
<b>Base Bid No. 1 - Extended Unit Prices</b>	Not Acknowledged	Not Acknowledged	N/A	N/A	Yes w/exception
<b>Base Bid No. 2</b>	No Bid	\$1,078,041.84	\$1,506,550.00	\$1,140,000.00	No Bid
<b>Base Bid No. 2 - Mandatory Alternate No. 1</b>	N/A	\$30,085.70	\$121,295.00	Included	N/A
<b>Base Bid No. 2 - Voluntary Alternate No. 1</b>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>Base Bid No. 2 - Unit Pricing</b>	N/A	Yes	Yes	Yes	N/A
<b>Base Bid No. 2 - Extended Unit Prices</b>	N/A	Not Acknowledged	Not Acknowledged	Yes w/exception	N/A
<b>Base Bid No. 3</b>	No Bid	\$487,098.40	\$1,012,295.00	\$376,000.00	\$409,900.00
<b>Base Bid No. 3 - Voluntary Alternate No. 1</b>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>Base Bid No. 3 - Voluntary Alternate No. 2</b>	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>Base Bid No. 2 - Unit Pricing</b>	N/A	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
<b>Base Bid No. 2 - Extended Unit Prices</b>	N/A	Not Acknowledged	Not Acknowledged	Yes w/exception	Yes w/exception

# MEETING ATTENDANCE RECORD

Date: April 11, 2024 Time: 2:00 PM

Project Name: Warren Consolidated Schools District-Wide Technology Improvements Bid Package No. T4 Warren, Michigan Location: Warren Consolidated Schools Administration Building 31300 Anita Drive Warren, MI 48093

IDS Project No.: 22177-1000 BP-T4 Reason for Meeting: Bid Opening

NAME (Please Print)	REPRESENTING	PHONE/EMAIL	
		Phone:	Email:
Nick Pitrone	Warren Consolidated Schools	Phone:	npitrone@wcskids.net
Susan Andrzejewski	Warren Consolidated Schools	Phone:	sandrzejewski@wcskids.net
Justin Marberg	Warren Consolidated Schools	Phone:	jmarberg@wcskids.net
Shawn Tyburski	Integrated Design Solutions, LLC	Phone:	248-823-2195
Kim Jones	Bluum	Phone:	612-455-3633
Long Hang	DAT	Phone:	810-275-2188
Jacob Weller	VSC	Phone:	248-325-7575
John Amon	The DataCom Group	Phone:	517-699-5000
		Email:	john@datacomgroup.com

cc: File

f:\2022\20177\1000\BP-T4\specs\mar001.docx

5211 cascade road se, ste. 300  
grand rapids, mi 49546

1441 w. long lake road, ste. 200  
troy, mi 48098

248-823-2100 www.ids-troy.com